Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2021

CHOE NMQ

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

®1) UMD L) @0, 2021 @RV 25
NLWd 25th August 2021
m\ielU;m ¢ 1197 2/levB0 9 m“,\’fc? 2481
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, Sth Chingam 1197
Wednesday 1943 @3(B0 3
3rd Bhadra 1943
GHh 03 MAINID
oo (Pl dldmoem-adl) Aldsa]
Qll226moalmo

MM 7733/6e105.012/2020/0l@mo. @l0g0Imma 0o, 2021 G 24
1197 afletro 8
1943 =oq30 2.

2021 @Y 23-00 GG 6608 NAIGERNA Qil8oeNIN6N|SIOBI @IS alO@YIN

&3SIMMMY e lomERMEBRE81Ss @RAlAIlERISID] DGIMI@ (@ IMSIRLEN|SICmIIM].

WNAIBERNIOS 2OMOQIMB (018000,

ail. a0dl Mmo®a,
Ml 6TVEeS0l.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2021-9e1 130-20 MMIA 6323l

2021-9£1 6HO8 Hal0}dls 6MIFo dO®ISIENS] chuamIwl
(cc®I) s393lmnadS
R0® OlojeRfleslend  ag)$lalOloensde  TVOAICNVOODI@  BHO8  VAUBGRNA

aflgoenioee SO ©).

2008-6)£1 BHHOB 6210}B5lS BMIF0 OMO¥IRINE] UMW @DEY

6RAVDI 2IgRMBIMI8s
&0}
a303lonad

aflole,.—2020-081 6H08 6210}&lS ™IS 6®I%lengl caundilul (6_EUVO)

®dSlmmmy  (2020-ee1  42) 2020 =oerl 29-0, @G HOB  VAIRENA

Qilgoenioes;omIloym @lmoelo;

2020 @RWVQY 2400 GO EalBMM GHO8 TLOMUNIM MIVWATLEWIOS
aLEMSMODI@ (EIN®® S0BAIMMAVIN aldh®o TVMNIM MIVWAMVEIOS 630}
@B OBMNZUOMBIMB8 6303 enilad MlwaaLEWI @PAIMGlelesmMalmyo

aIOROBNM Mo BSl@IBlOM @IMOoel}o;

@INO® &a3lmadmileel aljainunsud mleimldomam@lmnol 2020-0e1 6608
8210)@ls 6350 OMISIeNg] eauamlull (6e3L®I) sodlmmmy (2020-ee1 60) 2020

6MaiqoenId 26-00 GG H08 NAIBRNA Ail8oenIneq |S}OTl@IloM@IMoeI}o;

2020 allavoenid 31-00 @] G2IBM GHOS ALoMLNIM MIVWAMVEWIHS
muesmOmlee 2021 88mMIdl 8-00 D@ @OoEls] 2021 23mM3Idl 22-00 IO
@OQINVOM2ERAODW EHOS MVOMNIM MIVANVE@OS MVEIASMODILI0 (@ISO
&23SIMMMSIM}ald:00 MoMNIM MIWATVEWIAS B0} BYBQ SB:I6M3AUOIMMIMSS
630} enil@d mlameclcd @AMl flesymalmyo aIOOBM@IMYo

&lomloymmlmoelo;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




@INV@® &a3clmnadmileel aljaInunseud Mleimldomim @lmoil 2021-6e1 6608
8210)8ls 6mIg0 OMIIeNg]l eauamlul (eI sdduslmamday (2021-ee1 12) 2021

6anENRAAG] 9-0o MG B8 VAUBHNE Qllgoenioee]s;OmIAOM @IMoeRo;

2021 ¢a@ 24-00 BV @YOoEla] 2021 233613 10-00 GG EPAAVIM]o| BHOS
MLOMNOM  MIWAMVEWIHDS  TVEIASMEILIOD  (EITVO®  603WIMmMaSIMNald:0o0
MoMNOM MIVAMVEWIDS &0} BB  OBIEMAURMOIMB8 803  6nilad

N@aMEDI@ GRAIMGlQ{leemM@IMie aldqOBHM@IMIe ;@I @ImoeRo;

@INO® s303clnmmileel alninne:ud mleimldommaimoell 2021-ee1 6608
0210)@ls 6350 OMISIeNg]l eauamluwl (6BL®I) sadImmmY (2021-ee1 84) 2021

21068l 1-00 GO 66:08 NAIGERHA Qllgcenioeqy|syOmIloM@Imoelo;

2021 230681 22-00 GBI CYOElL] 2021 @MY 13-00 GV @PAIMIM])
GHOS8 MoMNIM MIANVE@IAS TVEIASMNGILIOND) [ ITIMI® 303NV old0o0
MoMNOM MIVAMEWIDS &0} OBV OBIEMBAURMOIMS8 803  6nildd

rleacvel@d @AmGlo{leam@Im]o aldq@ReM@IMIe d:¥lodloymalmoelo;

ROOMOMINR BOEMALISM@NS 213-00 @OM}B5JRo (2)-00 6U6MWo (ag)) Daleremb
@1:000 (E@INM®  SAWIMMMSIM 2021 ©MValgoeni@ 2-00 @IV (@ loenIelo

L0V @AM @IMIL0;

@@  adallmmdadleel  alQINGWd  Mlem3emIdTIOlealm  alddHo

6)6)()_I03436'GY306 QGT@O«:G:&G)(TT)@’](T)OEI(;OQ

BHO8 MoMNIM MIATVE MVEIASMOBILILIOMBIMOLI0 @I TVM|O MSals
a)S}CHOMD® G@YQIUDIMIBIIM MaNal0IEBRUd Mlelaileneemzay 608 NQIRENAHS)

@6NI0RLIMOIDIBlBNM @IMIEI0;

DG 008, @P@IMI@, BIOOOTIONG BOEMLISM@OS 213-0o @PMYBaIG0 (1)-00
QUEMWEI®I00 M@DHOq]s GOWlB00630d  alldlewouils), 608  vAIBENA

92690 |0 SAWIMMY Qil80enIne)e |SIoYmIIMI—

1. 21)0)B9Be |00 (@1000EAI0.—(1) M aodallmadavlal 2021-6081 GH08 6.2103lS

eMI30 6©®I%1e108] eauamlull (6eRLWMI) B30BAIMMMY ag)MY Gald alO@o.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(2) @ 2020 =meeel 300, OO (@EOMIEKO®I@  AUM®I

‘e;(og@s)cacssmcomsrﬁ.

2.2008-0e1 17-00 @) ®I@L0eldHAID] BEEROMI 601 |ESENZMIET).—EDD

&a03ulmaday mlelailelldleanym &oe1o) 2008-081 8508 9)210)d5lS 8MIS0 OISR
UMWl @SQIM  (2008-0e1 17) (DGIMIEUDaHo  (@IWIM BBBY  ag)TNIEM
al000BUlE0e|SId)  3-00 Q]G  QABONILSIDVITIeOIM  BREUNDTIBUdHE

aillew@ao@] (@ 10enIelmeNEoIcleaym @os).

3. 5-00 QI {1603 BEERNDBI.—(EIWOM BBBFIORI 5-00 Qld:q {I@d,—

(i) (1)-00 DalQIBfl@ “MRFl DOJI® BJalt” )M QAUIBNG:UDSBE) ald:0o “Mygl

2)eNBal® 0Jal” ag)0MN QUIONGHUD BalBBHENBMIG);

(ii) (2)-00 DalQIB)fl@ “MQ] DI BYat” oM AUOHEBUBLE ald:0o “Mig]

2)6eN0al® 0Jal” ag)aM QIIBGUD GalBBHLENBTIG;

(ii1) (3)-00 QalQId}ofl@ “o3MGl MO |@} ©Jal” o) QIOLOIBUDHE)

aldo “mM gl @ROI® 0ol af)aM QAUILOIGUD B2lGBLHENBMIGN).

4. 0G980LI0 89l0eeeRe.—(1) 2021-081 6HO8 ©2l10}BIS IS H®IYIRINE]

UMWl (6cRV®I) sodalMmmMM (2021-6e1 84) @IMI@ 038 DIolesymm;.

(2) ®RReOM 03I8SIDIOMOIGOMEM @Yo, (EIMIT® BIBUIMABAY (@ 18000
6ERNTI  ©aIQea]s  IWOM  CYBIIMBBIFID  HADDMEMO  HaIDO®IV
HSHO)MES)MMEMO  CPY®  oBOOHIE0  SIOGRD  af)SIOMEDI  af)SIOV@O]
B0}MS}MEMI AP aBO@ B0 MSalSIE@I, D BOBWIMIMY (@ 18000 GRRWM)
6219003 (@1WoOmM @BGlada51$l@d 6) 21D O@ICWI 2)S}ODMD@ICI
B O}ME|ESEBMOIEN.

@Q0lafl M}aOMAE 61003,
DUICGP®D.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No0.7733/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 24th August, 2021

8th Chingam,1197
2nd Bhadra, 1943.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2021 (130 of 2021).

By order of the Governor,

V. HARI NAIR,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2021-6£1 6808 ©.210}&5ls 63250 H®I¥IeNs] MWl
(eeeL®]) a303aImadaS” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 130 OF 2021

THE KERALA SMALL PLANTATION WORKERS” WELFARE FUND
(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2021

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic of
India.

AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Small Plantation Workers® Welfare Fund Act, 2008.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, the Kerala Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (42 of 2020) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on
the 29th day of July, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala
during its session convened on the 24th day of August, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (60 of 2020) was
promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 26th day of September, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which convened on the 31st day of December, 2020 and during its session
which commenced on the 8th day of January, 2021 and ended on the 22nd day of
January, 2021;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (12 of 2021) was
promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 9th day of February, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which commenced on the 24th day of May, 2021 and ended on the 10th
day of June, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (84 of 2021) was
promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 1st day of July, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which commenced on the 22nd day of July, 2021 and ended on the 13th
day of August, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, under sub-clause (a) of clause (2) of Article 213 of the Constitution of

India, the said Ordinance will cease to operate on the 2nd day of September, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, difficulties will arise if the provisions of the said Ordinance are not kept

alive;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session, and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the the Kerala

Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 30th day of July, 2020.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2. Act 17 of 2008 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Small Plantation Workers” Welfare Fund Act, 2008 (17 of 2008)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the amendments

specified in section 3.
3. Amendment of section 5.—In the principal Act, in section 5,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words “one

hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred and twenty rupees”, the words

“one hundred and eighty rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii1)) in sub-section (3), for the words “two hundred and forty rupees”, the words

“three hundred and sixty rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Repeal and saving—(1) The Kerala Small Plantation Workers’ Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (84 of 2021) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or deemed to have been done or any
action taken or deemed to have been taken under the principal Act as amended by the said
Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as amended by

this Ordinance.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES

AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 202 ki Digitally signed by Salim A
Thisisadigitally signed Gazette. Date:2021.08.25 07:46:59 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




		2021-08-25T19:46:59+0530
	Salim A




